
 

Item Qty Item Description

Taylor 
Music, 

Inc
Zeagler 
Music

Washingto
n Music 
Center

Nick Rail 
Music, Inc

Lafayette 
Music

K&S 
Music *

Universal 
Melody 
Services WWBW

1 1 Piccolo, Gemeinhardt 4PSH 535.00        548.00         581.00          574.00         579.00         No Bid 645.00         530.00         
2 2 Flute, Gemeinhardt 30 282.00        348.00         290.00          275.00         290.00         No Bid 275.00         No Bid
3 1 Oboe, Fox Renard 330 3,030.00     3,700.00      3,033.00       3,189.00      3,075.00      No Bid 3,145.00      3,160.00      
4 1 Bassoon, Fox Renard 51 3,929.00     4,895.00      3,917.00       4,105.00      3,988.00      No Bid 4,065.00      4,080.00      
5 4 Clarinet, Buffet E12F 944.00        1,125.00      987.00          950.00         1,099.00      No Bid 1,020.00      981.00         
6 4 Bass Clarinet, Selmer 1430LP 1,469.00     1,710.00      1,463.30       1,560.00      1,469.00      No Bid 1,538.00      1,670.00      
7 3 Tenor Saxophone, Yamaha YTS-480 1,919.00     2,157.00      1,900.75       1,495.00      1,667.00      No Bid No Bid 1,998.00      
8 2 Baritone Saxophone, Yamaha YBS-52 4,114.00     4,620.00      4,071.85       3,300.00      4,095.00      2,750.00      No Bid 4,505.00      
9 9 Trumpet, Yamaha YTR-8835 1,797.00     2,014.00      1,775.15       1,695.00      1,785.00      No Bid No Bid 1,965.00      

10 7 French Horn, Conn 8D 3,322.00     3,865.00      3,309.20       2,695.00      3,324.00      No Bid 3,475.00      3,770.00      
11 9 Trombone, Yamaha YSL8820 2,122.00     2,376.00      2,093.05       1,895.00      2,105.00      No Bid No Bid 2,201.00      
12 6 Euphonium, Yamaha YEP-321 1,711.00     1,821.00      1,687.55       1,295.00      1,697.00      No Bid No Bid 1,871.00      
13 6 Tuba 4/4 with Case, Yamaha YBB-321WC Series 4,494.00     5,054.00      4,454.45       3,600.00      4,479.00      No Bid No Bid 4,930.00      
14 6 Tuba 3/4 with Case, Yamaha YBB-105WC Series 2,696.00     3,016.00      2,658.40       1,995.00      2,673.00      No Bid No Bid 2,980.00      
15 6 Sousaphone with Hard Case, Yamaha YSH-301WC Series 3,555.00     3,986.00      3,513.15       3,759.00      3,532.00      No Bid No Bid 3,970.00      
16 1 Timpani, Set of 4, Yamaha TP-4300R Series 8,222.00     9,026.00      7,955.20       8,510.00      7,999.00      No Bid No Bid No Bid
17 1 Concert Bass Drum with Tiltable Stand and Cover, 36" X 16", Yamaha CB7036CS7 1,366.00     1,501.00      1,323.05       1,415.00      1,330.00      No Bid No Bid No Bid
18 12 Xylophone with Bag and Stand, 3- Octave, Yamaha YX230CSWC 777.00        931.00         820.50          878.00         825.00         No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 2 Snare Drum, Maple Shell, Yamaha CSM-1450 359.00        410.00         348.40          372.00         350.00         No Bid No Bid 390.00         
20 17 Snare Drum Stand, Concert Height, Yamaha SS-745A 72.00          88.00           77.00             75.00           73.00           No Bid No Bid 83.00           
21 7 Cymbol Stand, Yamaha CS-750 59.00          54.00           65.00             51.00           50.00           No Bid No Bid 46.00           
22 7 Cymbal Boom Stand, Yamaha SS-755 64.00          59.00           70.00             55.00           52.00           No Bid No Bid No Bid
23 10 Practice Pad with Stand, 10", Remo RT-0010-00 64.00          72.00           80.00             69.00           69.00           No Bid No Bid 64.00           
24 15 Practice Pad, Vic Firth Heavy Hitter Slim Pad 25.99          36.00           35.00             29.00           29.00           No Bid 50.00           No Bid
25 1 Granite Block Set, LP1210 139.99        229.00         180.00          155.00         169.00         No Bid 215.00         136.00         
26 1 Bongo with Stand and Bag, LP Matador Series 266.00        299.00         No Bid 249.00         260.00         No Bid No Bid No Bid
27 1 Keyboard with Bag, Yamaha HD-200 911.00        1,049.00      957.00          947.00         895.00         No Bid No Bid 1,090.00      
28 1 Digital Piano with Bench, Yamaha Clavinova CLP635 No Bid 1,498.00      No Bid No Bid 1,900.00      No Bid No Bid 2,420.00      
29 1 Bass Amp, Fender Rumble 200 No Bid 399.00         425.00          No Bid 340.00         No Bid No Bid 375.00         
30 1 Keyboard Amp, Roland KC-550 No Bid 549.00         557.00          495.00         520.00         No Bid No Bid 550.00         

* - Bid rejected; Name of Vendor was not listed on all pages of the Bid Form as required per Instructions to Bidders
- Rejected; Not noted as SUB on Bid Form but included on Substitute Items Form
- SUB
- Low bid; however, SUB is not equal to brand specified
- Lowest Responsive and Responsible Bidder for this particular line item

Unit Cost
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